
G-01-10
Janitorial Supplies
 for Smith County

Items Am San Chem Search Staples Chem Serve Sierra Baxter

flat mop heads 5.07$           no bid 7.89$          no bid 4.97$            5.88$         
mop handles 4.60$           no bid no bid no bid 3.97$            5.14$         
push brooms 7.65$           no bid 16.71$        no bid 8.95$            12.70$       
push brooms handles 2.99$           no bid 2.31$          no bid 2.90$            3.85$         
kitchen brooms 5.36$           no bid 9.28$          no bid 4.94$            6.45$         
bowl brushes 1.75$           no bid 4.67$          no bid 1.68$            2.77$         
pumice bar soap 43.48$         no bid 58.23$        no bid 39.50$          44.50$       
germicide 24.11$         120.70$         35.48$        81.80$             21.18$          42.00$       
multi-purpose cleaner 33.75$         116.45$         27.60$        69.95$             17.68$          27.60$       
floor finish 51.90$         122.70$         102.04$      99.95$             45.57$          49.80$       
wax sealer 53.75$         138.20$         48.12$        no bid 38.89$          49.80$       
stripper (non-ammoniated) 45.75$         120.70$         146.89$      93.95$             25.50$          49.80$       
stripper (ammoniated) 52.53$         no bid no bid 121.90$           28.95$          no bid
bagged liquid hand soap 25.51$         no bid 26.28$        no bid 26.10$          37.40$       
air freshener 35.02$         no bid 27.48$        79.95$             24.17$          49.80$       
spray disinfectant 39.40$         117.35$         25.32$        89.95$             22.99$          47.90$       
abrasive cleaner 24.68$         96.71$           38.64$        no bid 21.59$          41.28$       
trash can liners 15x9x32 19.01$         no bid 25.42$        no bid $17.75/1000 15.14/500
trash can liners 23x17x46 $13.77/100 no bid 15.68$        no bid $21.99/250 $15.14/100
trash can liners 22x16x58 32.91$         no bid 23.37$        no bid 19.95$          29.80$       
paper towels 22.19$         no bid 18.43$        no bid 17.99$          22.40$       
paper towel dispensers no bid no bid 53.33$        no bid 37.95$          45.00$       
multi-fold paper towels 18.38$         no bid 22.52$        no bid 17.99$          26.90$       
multi-fold paper towel dispenser no bid no bid 44.29$        no bid 12.95$          30.00$       
small roll toilet tissue 33.10$         no bid 38.55$        no bid 33.30$          39.90$       



G-01-10
Janitorial Supplies
 for Smith County

Items Am San Chem Search Staples Chem Serve Sierra Baxter

jumbo toilet tissue 21.76$         no bid 27.49$        no bid 23.97$          25.20$       
jumbo tissue dispenser no bid no bid 15.88$        no bid 37.86$          25.00$       
Styrofoam cups 8 oz. no bid no bid 20.00$        no bid 17.85$          22.11$       
Styrofoam cups 16 oz. no bid no bid no bid no bid 36.57$          no bid
Styrofoam cups 20 oz. no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.69$          28.40$       
spray buff no bid no bid 3.39$          no bid 24.50$          5.40$         
buffer pads 20" no bid no bid 28.27$        no bid 19.43$          19.28$       
polishing pads 19" no bid no bid 26.00$        no bid 17.40$          19.28$       
stripping pads 19" no bid no bid 26.00$        no bid 17.40$          19.28$       
stainless steel polish cleaner no bid 79.00$           28.20$        no bid 26.75$          19.80$       
furniture polish no bid no bid no bid no bid 81.59$          39.80$       
glass cleaner no bid 148.32$         108.44$      no bid 14.80$          69.80$       
latex gloves non-powdered (small) no bid no bid 45.70$        no bid 45.65$          54.00$       
latex gloves non-powdered (medium) no bid no bid 45.70$        no bid 45.65$          54.00$       
latex gloves non-powdered (large) no bid no bid 45.70$        no bid 45.65$          54.00$       
laundry detergent no bid no bid 36.31$        no bid 20.93$          28.90$       
dust mop no bid no bid 7.04$          no bid no bid no bid
liquid bleach no bid no bid 22.68$        no bid 11.70$          17.50$       
Purell NXT  hand sanitizer refill no bid no bid 87.48$        no bid 83.99$          89.30$       
*Item awarded based on price per quantity

Statistics Awarded vendors:
FY07 - 10 bids sent/4 returned Am San -Melody Jones- 903-830-8646-mjones@amsan.com
FY08 - 9 bids sent/5 returned Staples -Periann Ford -  periann.ford@staples.com
FY09 - 12 bids sent/8 returned Sierra - Randy McCoy - 903-534-8875 - randy.sierra@yahoo.net
FY10 - 18 bids sent/8 returned Baxter - Denny Kienzle - 903-593-2899 - denny@baxtersales.com
3 disqualified
FY10 - 18 bids sent/8 returned
2 disqualified


