G-01-13
Janitorial Supplies

1tems Sierra Ables-Land Dixie Paper Baxter Clean Care All American Pol Interboro Packagin Central Pol Pyramid School Products
flat mop heads $ 4.16 6.10 ea 3.71ea 5.86 ea no bid no bid no bid 279ea
mop handles wood $ 3.75 4.30 ea 117ea 6.35 ea no bid no bid no bid 2.99 ea
mop handles steel 52 inch $ 5.49 no bid 5.71ea -34.26 case 5.3lea no bid no bid no bid no bid
mop handles steel 60 inch $ 7.38 no bid 10.88 ea - 65.28 case 8.78 ea no bid no bid no bid 4.29 ea -25.74 case
mop pad holder $ 21.98 nobid | $ 22.92 no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.29 ea - 27.48 case
push broom $ 13.69 no bid 32.93 ea 16.04 ea no bid no bid no bid 7.29 ea
|push brooms handles $ 367 (9% 3.00 11.07ea 3.70 ea no bid no bid no bid 2.28ea
kitchen brooms $ 5185 no bid 6.13 ea 7.33¢ea no bid no bid no bid 3.78 ea
bowl brushes $ 278 no bid 275ea 2.50 ea no bid no bid no bid 169ea
bowl brushes handle $ 135 nobid | $ 0.90 no bid no bid no bid no bid 49 ea
|pumice bar soap 42.25 case no bid 54.68 case 45.08 case 1o bid no bid no bid 40.99 case
hand soap 27.91 case nobid | $ 40.70 33.35 case no bid no bid no bid no bid
|germicide 22.98 case no bid 60.34 case 42.30 case no bid no bid no bid no bid
multi-purpose cleaner 27.76 case 3290 case | $ 32.16 40.00 case no bid no bid no bid 23.99 case
hand sanitizer no bid no bid $55.69 20z - $48.31 80z - $63.91 120z 76.73 case- 120z - 12/case no bid no bid nobid|  23.88 case 8 0z - 35.88 case 18 0z
floor finish 54.35 pl 91.33 case 56.44 case no bid no bid no bid no bid
wax sealer 68.70 pl 64.94 pl 57.83 pl no bid no bid no bid no bid
stripper (non-ammoniated) 46.68 pl 48.4 pl 32.64 pl no bid no bid no bid no bid
stripper (ammoniated) 60.61 pl 68.39 pl no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
|bagged liquid hand soap 8.95ea Ak ARk *29.60 case 33.35 case no bid no bid no bid no bid
air freshener 26.20 case $40.77case - 200z cans - 12/case 29.57 case no bid no bid no bid 28.99 case - 200z - 12/case
spray disinfectant 24.49 case 92.49 case 73.80 case no bid no bid no bid 70.99 case
abrasive cleaner 23.47 case 33.06/case 320z 12 cans/case 37.04/case 210z 24 cans/case no bid no bid no bid 23.98/case 210z 24 cans/case
trash can liners 15x9x32 15.42 case 18.17 case 1000 count 23.53 case 500 count | 23.25 case 500 count | 14.48 case 1000 count 25.40 case 1000 count no bid
trash can liners 23x17x46 25.25 case 19.99 case 100 count 18.55 case 100 count | 11.13 case 100 count| 21.98 case 250 count 26.00 case 250 count no bid
trash can liners 22x16x58 23.23 case 22.43 case 100 count 26.73 case 100 count | 15.45 case 100 count| 16.72 case 100 count 17.90 case 100 count no bid
trash liners L 38x58 no bid 18.21 case 32.85 case | 15.45 case 100 count| 14.24 case 100 count 16.10 case no bid
trash liners S 24x33 no bid 26.29 case 28.10 case | 23.98 case 500 count| 14.34 case 1000 count 16.00 case no bid
aper towels 12rolls/case 16.29 case $25.90 - 30/case 26.80 case 18.36 case no bid no bid 17.66 case no bid
Brown Roll paper towels 17.90 case no bid 26.80 case 18.36 case no bid no bid 17.92 case no bid
paper towel dispensers no bid 10.00 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
multi-fold paper towels white 18.49 case 19.51 case 27.96 case no bid no bid 20.10 case no bid
multi-fold paper towels brown 15.43 case 19.51 case | $ 20.37 no bid no bid no bid no bid
multi-fold paper towel dispenser 30.88 case 5 each no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.98ea
small roll toilet tissue 26.95 case | $32.50 case -500 sheet/roll- 96 rolls/cs $34.20 case 400 sheet - 96 rolls/cs | 38.60 case 500 sheet- 96 rolls/case no bid no bid| 42.66 case 500 sheet - 96 rolls/cs no bid
toilet tissue dispenser no bid nobid | $ 5.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.29ea
tri fold paper towel - Brown no bid $ 1951 | $ 20.37 no bid no bid 17.98 case no bid
tri fold paper towel - White no bid $ 25.22 22.50 case no bid no bid 18.66 case no bid
jumbo toilet tissue $ 19.95 $26.99 -1000ft/roll - 12/case $22.23 - 800ft/roll - 12/case $26.43 - 1000ft/roll - 12/case no bid no bid 27.66 case - 1000ft/roll- 12/cs no bid
coreless toilet paper no bid nobid | $ 60.69 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
jumbo tissue dispenser $ 3110 no bid 5 each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Styrofoam cups 6 oz. $ 16.32 18.03 - 1000/case 18.50 - 1000/case 18.84 - 1000/case no bid no bid no bid no bid
Styrofoam cups 8 oz, $ 2008 | $ 18.96 21.64 - 1000/case 19.64 - 1000/case no bid no bid no bid no bid
Styrofoam cups 16 oz. $ 3923 | $ 19.30 44.34 - 500/case 38.29 - 1000/case no bid no bid no bid no bid
|spray buff $ 19.95 no bid $33.49 quart sz - $39.36 gallon sz | 42.90 quart sz - $67.26 gallon sz no bid no bid no bid no bid
buffer pads 20" $ 14.88 i $17.21 case 14.95 case - red no bid no bid no bid 11.89 - case red
buffer pads 20" white $ 14.88 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
buffer pads 20" black $ 14.88 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
polishing pads $ 14.88 $17.21 case 14.95 case no bid no bid no bid 11.89 case
stripping pads $ 14.88 $17.21 case 14.95 case o bid o bid no bid 11.89 case
mopping pads 35.40 case $125.64 case no bid no bid no bid no bid 39.48 case
stainless steel polish cleaner $ 26.13 $39.00 - 12/case $29.38 case - 12/case 40.05 case - 12/case no bid no bid no bid 26.98 cs - 180z - 12/case
furniture polish 27.99 case no bid $40.77 case - 200z -12/case 38.89 case - ?0z-12/case no bid no bid no bid 27.89 case - 170z -12/case
glass cleaner 17.71 case 13.50 case $38.20 case 26.15 case no bid no bid no bid 20.98 case
disinfectant spra 24.49 case - 16.502 $49.99 case 12cans/case- 190z $45.60 case 12cans/case - 200z 36.35 case 12 cans/case 20z no bid no bid nobid| 27.15 case - 12 cans/case - 16.5 0z
isi 1t wipes 23.37case-75 ct/6 case 49.99 case 80/tub 12tubs/ct $38.07 case 75/ct 33.60 case 75/ct - 6/case no bid no bid no bid 28.89 case - 75ct
latex gloves non-powdered (sm) | 10 per case 45.80 case no bid $51.50 case 60.63 case no bid 41.00 case no bid 38.90 case
latex gloves non-p: (m) 10 per case 45.80 case i $51.50 case 60.63 case no bid 41.00 case no bid 38.90 case
latex gloves non-powdered (Ig) 10 per case 45.80 case $51.50 case 60.63 case no bid 41.00 case no bid 38.90 case
laundry detergent 22.95 - 501b con 30.82 each - 50Ib per container 31.65 case - ?lb no bid no bid no bid no bid
liquid bleach 9.95 case - 6 gal case 10.73case 4gal/case - 13.53case 6gal/case 14.06 case 6gal/case no bid no bid no bid no bid
Purell NXT hand sanitizer refill no bid no bid no bid no bid
*Item awarded based on price per quantity based in NJ based ion NY based in NJ based in FL

deliery time 10-14 days

Must order in cases




