ltems

flat mop heads
mop handles, 60"

mop handles, 52", steel quick connect

mop pad holder, 18" quick connect
push brooms

push brooms handles

kitchen brooms

bowl brushes

pumice bar soap

germicide

multi-purpose cleaner

hand sanitizer

floor finish

wax sealer

stripper (non-ammoniated)
stripper (ammoniated)

bagged liquid hand soap

air freshener

spray disinfectant

abrasive cleaner

trash can liners 15x9x32, 1000 ct
trash can liners 23x17x46, 250 ct
trash can liners 22x16x58, 100 ct
paper towels, brown

tri-fold paper towels, white
paper towel dispensers
multi-fold paper towels
multi-fold paper towel dispenser
small roll toilet tissue

G-01-12
Janitorial Supplies
for Smith County

Reinhart Food Service Central Poly Corp.

$ 5.36 no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
$ 37.98 no bid
$ 3.33 no bid
no bid no bid
$ 44.93 no bid
no bid no bid
$ 7.96 no bid
no bid no bid
$ 30.48 no bid
$ 3.99 no bid
$ 3.61 no bid
$ 28.81 no bid
$ 26.03 $ 16.20
$ 21.07 $ 27.80
$ 2781 $ 20.40
$ 2187 $ 16.80
$ 23.09 $ 16.90
$ 2733 $ 19.30
$ 2447 $ 19.99
$ 2049 $ 10.93
$ 3063 $ 43.66

Chem-Serv, Inc.
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no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
83.80
5.83
no bid
99.95
no bid
17.99
121.90
no bid
no bid
89.95
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
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Baxter

6.59
6.59
35.40
4.88
17.85
4.19
8.19
2.77
47.40
44.60
6.57
no bid
48.82
63.35
6.30
no bid
34.17
33.78
57.90
30.95
23.80/500
16.50
26.90
23.14
25.70
no bid
25.70
no bid
38.50

Sierra/Buyboard
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5.92
5.31
6.50
9.25
19.34
8.04
5.85
2.26
42.25
23.50
2.64
45.67
69.90
99.50
11.60
no bid
28.95
2.15
2.06
23.95
19.75
13.95
19.97
18.25
19.95
14.50
17.91

31.00
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Items Reinhart Food Service Central Poly Corp. Chem-Serv, Inc. Baxter

toilet tissue dispenser nobid $ 10.99 no bid no bid

jumbo toilet tissue $ 2639 $ 24.99 nobid $ 29.20 $ 25.30
jumbo toilet tissue dispenser no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Styrofoam cups 8 oz. $ 16.67 no bid no bid $ 2745 $ 18.75
Styrofoam cups 16 oz. $ 29.91 no bid nobid $ 4980 $ 36.99
spray buff, quart size no bid no bid no bid $ 5.20 no bid
spray buff, gallon size $ 30.34 no bid nobid $ 1538 $ 32.50
buffer pads 20" $ 18.89 no bid nobid $ 19.28 $ 19.91
polishing pads 19" $ 18.37 no bid nobid $ 2212 3 17.99
stripping pads 19" $ 18.83 no bid nobid $ 2212 $ 17.99
mopping pads, 18" blue microfiber no bid no bid nobid $ 8340 $ 40.32
stainless steel polish cleaner $ 19.63 no bid nobid $ 59.80 $ 26.75
furniture polish $ 30.74 no bid nobid $ 81.60

glass cleaner $ 13.89 no bid nobid $ 4277 % 14.95
disinfectant wipes $ 28.74 no bid nobid $ 38.40 $ 38.97
latex gloves non-powdered (small) $ 3781 $ 91.63 nobid $ 69.20 $ 67.50
latex gloves non-powdered (medium) $ 3781 $ 91.63 nobid $ 69.20 $ 67.50
latex gloves non-powdered (large) $ 2641 $ 91.63 nobid $ 69.20 $ 67.50
laundry detergent $ 59.93 no bid nobid $ 29.14 $ 20.93
dust mop no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
liquid bleach, USDA approved 4 gal/cs no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
liquid bleach, 6 gal/cs $ 13.37 no bid nobid $ 1457 $ 11.70
percentage (%) discount on items not liste 0.00% 5.00% 5.00% 20.00% 20.00%
delivery 4 days per week 4-6 business days  4-6 business days 24 hr. Same day
delivery charge no yes, $60.00 no no no

rebates 2% rebate from Buyboard
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*1tem awarded based on price per quantity for Smith County

Statistics Awarded vendors:

FYO08 - 9 bids sent/5 returned Chem-Serv Inc, Tasia Tomany, 903-988-2215, chemserv@earthlink.com

FY09 - 12 bids sent/8 returned Reinhart Food service, Paul Navarre, 318-869-3061, pjnavarre@rfsdelivers.com
FY10 - 18 bids sent/8 returned Baxter - Denny Kienzle - 903-593-2899 - denny@baxtersales.com

3 disqualified Central Poly Corporation, Andrew Hoffer, 903-862-9019, bids@centralpoly.com
FY10 - 18 bids sent/8 returned Sierra Packaging, Randy McCoy, 903-534-8875, christi@sierrapackaging.net

2 disqualified

FY12 -18 bids sent/4 returned/1 no bid




